
HIGH COURT GRANTS 
CONTRACT WORKERS 
PERMANENT RIGHTS 

THE highest court in South 
Africa - the Appeal Court — has 
granted migrant workers who 
have worked for the same empl­
oyer for more than 10 years 
permanent city rights. 

This decision strikes a mighty 
blow agains the hated influx 
control system. 

With section 10 1 (b) rights, 
contract workers will now have 
the right to: 
— look for work in the towns. 
— if they find work they do not 

have to go back to the labour 
office to get registered. 

— they can move from one area 
to the next as long as they 
have legal accommodation. 

— they can live permanently in 
Ihe city. 

— (hey cannot be sent back to 
homelands if they become 
unemployed. 
But in order to get these rights 

workers must go to their nearest 
pass office with a letter from 
their employers proving that 
they have been registered with 
the same company for 10 years 
or more* 

FOSATU unions, particularly 
on the Reef where there arc 
thousands of migrant workers 
who now quality for 'city 
rights1, have appealed to empl­
oyers to assist their workers to 
get these rights. 

Since the decision of the 
Appeal Court, the govern­
ment has been threatening 

to block it, but recently the 
Minister of Co-operation and 
Development, Dr Koomhof, 
announced that it would imp­
lement the Court judgement. 

However, for the past few 
weeks the Administration 
Boards themselves have been 
blocking people getting their 
city rights-

On the East Rand, Admin­
istration Board officials have 
been telling workers that they 
can only take eight people a 
day. 

And even then, the officials 
are only giving the workers a 

number and telling them to 
come back next month for their 
Section 10 stamp* 

Adding to fears that the 
government will only allow a 
very few of migrant workers to 
get their section 10 rights, 
Koornhof said as little as 5000 
out of the 143000 might be 
given city rights. 

But unions and civil rights 
organisations arc gearing them­
selves up for a fight* 

Black Sash said if city rights 
were not granted, it would set 
up a panel of lawyers and fight 
each case in court. 
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THE MUCH SOUGHT AFTER SECTION 10 1(bJ STAMP 


