
Privileged People 

A SOUTH AFRICAN now living in 
Canada, who had been closely involved 

in political and social work here, wrote to a 
friend about bin life in his new country. He 
was comfortably settled in Canada, he said; 
he liked the people and was enjoying the ex­
perience of living in a stable and progressive 
democracy. Ycl something was missing: he 
felt the lack of no longer being engaged in the 
pursuit of an idea!. 

Many who read this article may well feel 
that they would happily change places with 
our Canadian friend, that the privilege of being 
engaged in the present grim struggle is Some­
thing they could easily do without. Yet the 
comment from Canada contains a great truth* 
of which we should remind ourselves m these 
days. It is a privilege to be a South African 
— white, brown or black -— who is fighting in 
some constructive and positive manner to 
replace the present order with a new way of 
life expressing the values of Western civiliza­
tion. 

To appreciate the extent of the privilege one 
must understand the nature of the struggle. 
It can be stated simply. The struggle arises 
from the contention that people ot different 

You cannot climb a ladder by pushing oilier, 
down. English prtnvrb. 
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races, cultures and background cannot live 
peaceably together in one society. Il has been 
referred lo as die doctrine of irreconcilability 
of interests. This doctrine is held b\ many 
more white people than the number that vote 
Nationalist. It is also, like a disease, infecting 
non-white people. This doctrine we in the 
Black Sash reject. 

Like most doctrines, il is almost impossible 
lo refule by logical argument. If a man says 
thai h is impossible for him lo Vive in amity 
with his neighbour, because he docs not like 
his neighbour and he is sure that his neighbour 
will harm him as soon as he gets a chance, one 
can onl> say that, for oneself, one refuses to 
allow one's life to be governed by such a pro­
position. Basically, it is a matter of ethical 
judgmcni. and ethical judgments stand beyond 
argument. 

* • * 

Nevertheless, the views one holds have 
practical consequences, and one can see the 
practical consequences of apartheid philosophy. 
We deem these consequences lo be evil. As the 
effects of one legislative enactment after 
another have become apparent we have tried 
to point Ihem out and lo protest against them. 
We have seen people removed from their 
homes, restricted in their employment dppor-
lunities. denied entry lo the established uni-
vcrsiiies. banished to distant parts, confined 
in their movements, prohibited from engaging 
in political activity, relegated to inferior social 
status. Every year the Slate's control over the 
lives of the citizens has become tighter. And 
now we have reached the stage where anyone 
who is considered to be "dangerous" may be 
locked up without trial. 

These evil consequences of the ruling politi­
cal philosophy cannot be condoned on the 
ground thai they are temporary. Oppressive 
laws can never remove opposition Lo oppres-
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sion. As the laws arc multiplied so does the 
opposition become more bitter and more 
determined. "1 know of only two ways in 
which people may be governed," someone once 
said: "one is by their consent and the other 
is by the sword." The terrible alternative to 
government by consent is now facing the 
Nationalist government. Yet in the long run 
there is no alternative to government by 
consent. 

It is no privilege to be in opposition to a 
regime that must inevitably fail. The privilege 
lies in having the opportunity to work for its 
peaceful failure, and to do one's best to ensure 
that the evil will be succeeded by good. It is 
accordingly one's prime duty to bear witness 
to the good. This, in the South African con­
text, means that one must assert, by deed as 
well as by word, that apartheid is a crime 
against humanity: that man can. indeed, live 
peaceably with man; that what we have in 
common — whether we be black, brown or 
white — is of a transcending order of import­
ance compared with the accidents of race and 
cultural background. We are called upon in 
South Africa to put into practice, and thereby 
to prove the practicability of. the doctrine of 
human brotherhood that philosophers and 
religious teachers have taught throughout the 
ages. 

This is the thought that leads our friend in 
Canada, and others in different parts of the 
world, to look at us here in South Africa, fear­
ful and depressed though many of us are. with 
something akin to envy. 
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