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VAXntBUM - A 
Zola chief tppcarad to tba 
Mphunrolcn*a Magistrate'* 
C • « r; ytatorday on 

, cterfeg of plofciflff - to 
•wrtt tw t h o kwaauhi 

CUof MbUboMlm Ma-
^isunlc appaarad before 
Mr C C Houna* at a court 
Of Inquiry Into mi con­
duct to answer acru»i-
t»on« that h« bad con-

trayraed tht nght*, prlvi-
lafaa~ and duttoe af a 
chief." 

The rummon* signed 
by Cbtaf Catsba Buthelezi, 
chargea that Chlaf Uaphu-
mulo WM a member of an 
organisation which aimad 
at tba "unconstitutional 
overthrow of the (kwaZu-
tut Government" and that 
he had encouraged resis-
tance to tha la* which 
required that the King of 
the Zulus, Paramount 

Chief Ouufldro, boH him 
self aloof from politic* 

Alternatively, Chief Ka-
phusiulo is accused of 
taking part in an or gams* -
t t o n whose objective* 
were "*ub**r*ive and pre­
judicial to the Govern­
ment or law and ordar • 

The second alternative 
chart* » tnat Chief Mi 
phumulo broke his oath 
a* a member o( the Legis­
lative A^embly. 

The Chief u a member 

•"ges 
of the MpAumulinfi Re­
gional Authority In the 
Hsmmfradalt district and 
head of the Maphunulo 
tnb*. 

After closing hit caae 
today, Mr E E Mcbunu 
(for Chief Maphumulo, 
said the inquiry was the 
upshot of a political ar­
gument and was aimed at 
the emasculation of cer­
tain section- *>f the Zulu 
population 

Judgment will be tlrrn 
on November 25 — Sapa 


