
TWIU 
distributes 
smear 
pamphlets 
TUCSA's Textile Workers Indus­
trial Union has stooped to smear 
tactics in an attempt to hold on 
to its declining membership. 

Since the National Union of 
Textile Workers opened a branch 
in the Western Cape, hundreds 
of TWIU members have been 
crossing the floor to join 
FOSATU. 

Recently 140 workers at 
BKB's Bellville wool warehouse 
resigned from the TUCSA union 
to join the hundreds that have 
resigned from TWIU at the giant 
Frame complex in New Ger­
many* 

NUTW now reports that less 
than a quarter of the work* 
ers at the New Germany com* 
plex belong to the TWIU -
yet Frame is insisting in main­
taining its recognition of the 
TUCSA union. 

NUTW Western Cape branch 
secretary, Virginia Engeh said 
that in sheer desperation, the 
TWIU had distributed hundreds 
of pamphlets in an attempt 10 
smear the general secretary of 
NUTW. 

The racist pamphlet attacks 
Brother Copelyn for being a 
'white attorney* and for wanting 
'to win the war with black 
workers* blood \ 

Commenting on the pamphlet, 
Brother Copelyn said TWIU fails 
to realise that workers were res­
igning from the TUCSA union 
because (hey get nothing out of 
itf not because NUTW*s general 
secretary *is a great guy\ 

He said TWIU had lost more 
members in the last two months 
than NUTW had lost in its entire 
existence. 

'Daniels k news that as a 
matter of principle we don't like 
to sue other unions and is 
therefore taking unreasonable 
liberties/ Brother Copelyn said. 


