
EVER since the agreement 
with Sasol in March this year, 
the Chemical Workers Indus-
trial Union has been working 
hard to rebuild and strengthen 
organisation at the Sasol plants 
and Sa6ol mines. 

In under four-months, the 
union has climbed back up to a 
paid-up majority in the plants. 
And as an added bonus, it now 
has a significant majority at 
the Sasol mines. 

T h i s i s a t r e m e n d o u s 
achievement for the CWIU 
which during the November 
stay-away last year watched 
Sasol fire 6 000 workers and 
b u s t h e m b a c k t o t h e 
homelands. 

In the March settlement, the 
company agreed to take back 
seventy percent of these work­
ers. It also agreed to formally 
recognise union shop stewards. 

The CWIU reports that at 
the Sasol II & III plants the 
team of shop stewards have 
been using their extra rights to 
fight and win many issues. 

Wages was one of the issues 
recently discussed with Sasol 
management. 

'Sasol makes vast profits but 
its wage levels are very low. 
We want a living wage for all 
workers,5 a union spokesperson 
said. 

In the wage talks, CWIU ar­
gued that management should 
not give a percentage increase 
as this would only widen the 

gap between the lower paid and 
the more highly paid workers. 

Tt was the workers earning 
only R300 per month that were 
s u f f e r i n g t h e mos t , 1 t h e 
spokesperson explained. 

The company finally agreed 
to pay workers on the bottom 
four grades an increase of R75 
per month from July 1 — the 
next three grades received a 
slightly higher cash increase. 

This represented a 25 percent 
increase for the lowest paid, 
and an overall increase of 19,3 
percent. 

Meanwhile, on the mines, 
where the CWIU has over 
5 000 members, things are real­

ly moving. 
An agreement on shaft ste­

ward rights has been completed 
and elections are due to take 
place soon. 

And already the union has 
begun to take up the 'appalling' 
wages and working conditions 
which exist on the mines. 

'Recently, it came to light 
t h a t a s y s t e m of h i d d e n 
dismissals was being practised 
on the mines.' 

'Although, there is a disci­
plinary procedure, manage­
ment was getting round this,' 
the CWIU spokesperson said. 

leave and renew the con­
tract they were often told, sor­

ry, your contract will not be 
renewed. There was no hearing 
and no appeal/ she added. 

After talks with the union, 
management agreed to discon­
tinue this practice. 

'AH dismissals must now fol­
low the procedure, which in­
cludes a system of warnings 
and a formal inquiry where 
shaft stewards will be present 
to represent workers,' she said. 

First time 
Commenting on the wages, 

the union spokesperson said 
that up to now Sasol had al­
ways paid the extremely low 
wage rates laid down by the 
Chamber of Mines. 

'But this year, for the first 
time, Sasol has paid increases 
above those g iven by t h e 
Chamber.' 

In terms of a wage agree­
men t nego t i a t ed w i th t h e 
CWIU, workers on the lowest 
grade received an increase of 
25 percent from July 1 — the 
o v e r a l l i n c r e a s e w a s 22 
percent. 

The wages of the Sasol work­
ers, and in particular the the 
mine workers, do not yet ap­
proach a l iving wage. ' the 
union spokesperson said. 

'However, these gains are a 
significant step forward. Sasol 
workers will go forward to the 
1986 negotiat ions with re­
newed determination to fight 
for a living wage for all,' she 
concluded. 


