
EMPOWERMENT 

World's women stake their claim 
By Jacklyn Cock 

The World Women's Congress for a 
Healthy Planet, held in Miami from 
November 8 to 12, brought together 

over a thousand women from 90 different 
countries* 

It was one of the meetings to prepare for 
the Earth Summit in Brazil next June when 
heads of state from around the world will 
attend and develop an Earth Charter to reg­
ulate economic development and environ­
mental protection for the planet. The World 
Women's Congress aimed to ensure that the 
Earth Charter has "a women's dimension", 

The predominant emphasis of the 
congress was on the linkages between the 
global economic and environmental crises-
The major sessions featured a panel of five 
women judges (from India, Sweden, Aus­
tralia, Kenya and Guyana) to hear testimony 
from diverse women ranging from Wangari 
vlaathaim, founder of the Green Belt move-
nent in Kenya speaking on deforestation, to 

-tosalie Bertell from Canada talking on the 
ueat of nuclear power and weapons to 

f ublic health and the environment. 
The congress exploded a powerful myth: 

•i at the military protects and defends us. 

The reality, numerous women insisted, is 
that the military is the greatest single threat 
to security. As Rosalie Bertell said, "it is the 
military who are destroying the earth and 
they are doing it in the name of "national 
security". The main source of environmental 
destruction is "the smart bombs, not aerosol 
deodorants"-

Three other themes emerged from the 
wealth of papers, films and talks presented: 
the first is that globally women are the shock 
absorbers of environmental problems. It is 
women who deal directly with the resource 
base, who, for example, gather wood and 
carry water in rural areas. It is mainly 
women who struggle to grow crops on 
eroded land and who are responsible for 
food preparation. The main victims of envi­
ronmental degradation are underprivileged 
people and the majority of these are women. 

The second theme is that increasingly it is 
women who are providing the energy and 
commitment to address environmental prob­
lems. But as Peggy Antrobus from the Uni­
versity of Barbados stressed, while women 
are cleaning up the mess at the local level, 
they are largely excluded from the institu­
tions which create the mess in the first place. 
So the third theme was the political empow­

erment of women. The congress resolved 
that all decision-making bodies should be 
made up of "no more than 60 percent and no 
less than 40 percent membership of either 
sex". The general consensus was that 
women can create a "healthy planet" based 
on human rights and a more just world eco­
nomic order. 

The congress was appropriately held in 
Miami, the scene of one of the worst envi­
ronmental crimes of the century - the 
destruction of the "river of grass", the Ever­
glades. Once a vast ecosystem that covered 
four million acres, the Everglades now 
occupy a mere 10 percent of their original 
expanse. What remains of this magical place 
is largely due to the conservation efforts of a 
group of women, and one women in particu­
lar, Marjorie Stoneman Douglas. Now 100 
years old, she was present at the congress 
and received a standing ovation. 

There are lessons for all of us from her life 
and the damage done to the Everglades; the 
first is a warning about the destructive 
power of irresponsible and greedy "develop­
ment". The second is about the creative 
power of women. 

Dr Jacklyn Cock is a sociologist and based at 
the University of theWitwatersrand. 

The 'double shift' taking its toll? 
By Ida Garlrell 

Wilh high 
hopes and 
great deter­

mination, Eshowe 
Child and Family 
Welfare launched 
Idasa's "Women in a 
New South Africa" 
workshops as part of a women's rights pro­
ject in August. Four workshops later (that's 
half-way through) we had to sit back and 
take stock of our goals and ideals. 

Our women's rights project started in 
April with a workshop entitled "Tribute to 
Women". Enthusiastic participation, stimu­
lating speakers, songs and poetry, and 
requests for more, more, more! 

The "Women in a New South Africa" 
workshops fitted the bill exactly - work­
shops to run once a month, every second 
Saturday morning and afternoon. 
The great day dawned and 34 women 
arrived! Women from church, welfare, ANC 
and Inkatha organisations, unions and pri­
vate individuals. They came from as far 
afield as Empangeni, Mandeni, Mtunzini, 
Amatikulu and Gingindhlovu. 

The end of that first workshop, "The Dou­
ble Shift", saw everyone determined to com­
mit themselves to the next five workshops, 
to bring along a friend, and maybe even start 
working towards a combined women's 
organisation. However, the next three work­
shops were attended by seven, six and four 
participants respectively! 

The evaluation proved interesting. Feed­
back included difficulties with transport, 
choice of day, venue, time, remembering and 
over-commitment, fear of husbands, 
boyfriends, the topics discussed and the 
magnitude of women's problems. "Women 
lacked responsibility," they said, "were too 
lazy, were quite happy to follow, but not to 
lead. It was too risky/' 

However - once again - those who 
attended felt that the workshops were really 

worthwhile and 
stimulating. They 
enjoyed meeting, 
learning, talking 
to other women, 
sharing ideas, and 
participating freely 
in discussions. 

They were curious 
and wanted to see the end result. The 
commitment seemed to be there. And yet...? 
Have we been targetting the wrong women? 

The workshops will continue until Febru­
ary. We decided to be more visible, have 
more face to face contact with other women, 
to hold "core" meetings separately from the 
workshops, and at the beginning of each 
meeting to check through our list of solu­
tions and demands from the previous work­
shop - and ask whether any women had 
made any progress. Women, we felt, needed 
to know that they were making advances, 
however small, in the struggle for women's 

rights. 
Ida (i iii t re II is a drama teacher and a town 

councillor in Eshowe. 
The " Women in a New South Africa" workshop 

package is available from Idasa's Media Department 
(1 Penzance Rd. Mmvbray 7700) at R16/X) 
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